
Chalet Babylon
Tignes les Brévières, France 

To Book, call +44 (0)203 432 7784

Futuristic design peppered with 
cutting edge features make this 
luxury ski chalet an intriguing choice 
for interior design connoisseurs. 
Think stylish furniture, original 
artwork and striking lighting. Then 
stroll out onto one of the private 
balconies and you’ll find the real 
jewel in the crown of this luxury 
south-facing chalet. The spectacular 
views of the resort of Tignes les 
Brevières and the beautiful lake 
have to be seen to be believed.

Conveniently, the village funicular is 
located just outside the chalet and 
runs most of the day to shuttle you 
to the main lift. When you’ve had 
your fill of snow and mountain air, 
you’ll find the perfect retreat at this 
luxury ski chalet. Open plan living 
across five levels are ideal for larger 
groups. Leave your ski gear in the 
private boot room and head upstairs 
to the open plan living area. Grab 
a glass of bubbly from the private 
bar and recline on large comfy 
sofas. Let the roaring fire warm you 

What we love...

The open plan living area with stunning views of the lake and Tignes les 
Brevieres.
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as you gaze at snow falling on the 
mountains. Shoot some pool on the 
chalet’s pool table or chill out in 
front of the TV or PS4 console.

If relaxation is key during your 
luxury ski holiday, you’ll find what 
you’re looking for in the chalet’s 
private sauna, steam room and 
massage room with hydro massage 
bed. Chalet Babylon also enjoys 
shared access to a wonderful indoor 
swimming pool, hammam and sauna 
which is located in the same building 
that houses this luxury ski chalet – 
perfect for soothing aching muscles. 

Come nightfall, enjoy your dinner 
around the atmospheric open plan 
kitchen and dining area, prepared 
by your chalet’s private chef on five 
evenings. 

You’ll feel instantly at home in 
the individually themed bedroom 
suites. Minimalistic design sets the 
scene for a peaceful night’s sleep to 
prepare you for another wonderful 
day on your luxury ski holiday.



Rooms

This luxury ski chalet sleeps up 
to 10 adults and 2 children in 5 
bedrooms. 

Bedroom one 
Bunk room with four full sized beds; 
en-suite shower room and TV. 

Bedroom two
Double bedroom with king-sized 
bed; en-suite bathroom with 
shower, bath and double basins, TV 
and balcony. 

Bedroom three 
Double bedroom with king-sized 
bed; en-suite bathroom with shower 
and bath, TV and Juliet balcony. 

Bedrooms four and five
Double bedrooms with king-sized 
beds; en-suite bathrooms with 
shower and bath, TV. These rooms 
share a toilet on the landing.

Rates are based on occupancy of 
up to 10 guests (additional guests 
carries a supplement charge).
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Eating

Each day will commence with a 
delicious continental breakfast with 
cooked options on five mornings – 
perfect fuel for the day ahead. 

Guests at the residence can enjoy 
après ski on a large private terrace 
which looks over the resort and 
provides the perfect setting to 
reflect on the exploits of your 
day. Fire pits and furs will keep 
you warm as the bar serves up 
incredible signature cocktails (at 
additional cost). 

Five nights a week, your private 
chef will serve gourmet dinner, 
giving you a chance to try out local 
restaurants on two evenings of your 
stay. You’ll also enjoy house wines 
and prosecco on your luxury ski 
holiday here, along with a drinks 
tray, including four bottles of spirits 
and signature Alepine beers.
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Kids

Children will love the quirky features 
here, not least the decorative 
motorbike in the games area! And, 
they’ll have fun splashing in the 
indoor swimming pool which Chalet 
Babylon shares with three other 
private chalets. There is also a pool 
table, and PS4 games console to 
keep younger guests entertained. 

At this luxury ski chalet junior diners 
can enjoy child friendly suppers at 
an appropriate time, prepared by 
the chalet’s chef. If you’ve brought 
your nanny, they’ll also be catered 
for. Alternatively, if you require 
childcare during your stay, that can 
be arranged on request. 

When bedtime comes, children 
will love snuggling down under the 
covers in the cosy bunkroom on 
their luxury ski holiday.

Location

Chalet Babylon is located in the 
village of Tignes les Brevières in the 
Espace Killy ski area with access to 
Val d’isère and Tignes. The village 
funicular located approximately 
50m from this luxury ski chalet will 
shuttle you to just across the road 
from the main lift station at the 
bottom of the village. 
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The nearest airport is Chambery, 
around 1h 45m away. Geneva 
airport is around 2h 30m away.

Staff

Firefly pre-arrival concierge service 

Chalet staff include:
Chalet host
Daily housekeeping
Chef

Additional staff such as nannies and 
massage therapists can be arranged 
on request.

Facilities

Outdoor hot tub
South facing balcony
Sauna 
Steam room 
Massage room with hydro massage 
bed
Fireplace
Pool table 
Bar Area 
TV 
PS4 with games 
Ski room
Access to a shared indoor swimming 
pool, sauna and hammam (located 
within the same building as Chalet 
Babylon) with three other chalets.
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